
MEMORANDUM

TO: Dr. Devin Stephenson

FROM3 lu lie Cotton,
Director, Fort Walton Beach Campus
Director, Hospitality and Tourism Management and Culinary Programs

DATE: September 9,20t9

SUBJECT: Bid Evaluation Committee Recommendation
ITB #2019-2020-01
On-Campus Greenhouse

Sealed proposal for the above referenced item were opened on Tuesday, August 27,
2019 at 2:00 p.m.

Bids were received as followsr
Ceres Greenhouse Solutions - Boulder, CO
The Greenhouse Company - Columbia, SC
United Greenhouse Systems, Inc. - Edgerton, WI
Winandy Greenhouse Co. Inc. - Richmond, IN

Recommendation:
Based on the analysis of the bid, the committee with lulie Cotton, Director, Fort
Walton Beach Campus; Director, Hospitality and Tourism Management and Culinary
Programs concludes the recommendation of award 9141.004.00 to United
Greenhouse Systems, Inc. as lowest responsible and responsive bidder.
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NOTICE OF INTENT TO AWART)

Title: On-Campus Greenhouse

Numberr ITB2O19-2O2O-O1

Northwest Florida State College opened bids in response to the above solicitation on August 27, 2ofg.:|he
following vendors responded with bids:

Bidders:
Ceres Greenhouse Solutions - Boulder, CO
The Greenhouse Company - Columbia, SC
United Greenhouse Systems, Inc. - Edgerton, WI
Winandy Greenhouse Co. Inc. - Richmond, IN

INTENT TO AWARD: Recommendation of award to the following:

United Greenhouse Systems. Inc.
Amount of Award: $ 141.004.00

BID PROTESTT After posting of recommendation of intent to award, any bidder or proposer who is
aggrieved in connection with the pending award may protest to the Director of Purchasing in accordance
with the NWFSC Purchasing, Sec. 120.57(3), Florida Statutes, Failure to file a notice of protest or failure
to file a formal written protest with the proper bond shall constitute a waiver of all rights granted under
Statute.

POSTING IS VALID FOR 72 CONSECUTIVE HOURS FROM THE DATE AND TIME STATED BELOW,
EXCLUDING SATURDAYS, SUNDAYS AND NWFSC HOLIDAYS.

POSTING TIME/DATE: Tuesday, September 17, 2Ot9 @ 3:OO pM CT.

NWF State College Fon Walton Beach Campus . (850) 863-6500
Chautauqua Center, DeFuniak 5prings. (850) 200-4100 Hurlburt Centet Hurlburt Field . (850)20G4190

Robert L. t Sikes Education Center, Crestview. (850)200-4141 south Walton Center, Santa Rosa Beach ' (850) 200-4160
An Equol Access/Equal Opportunity lnttitution



NORT HWEST f LORI DA rrB 2o'rs-2020-ol on-campus Greenhouse
Sf^l'tC()ltl(;t BidOpening Tuesday,August27,20'192:00PMCST

Burlding 31o/Conference Room

ComDany
Bidder

References
Drug Free

MBE Form
Public Entity Addendum

#1
Addendum

*2
Addendum

t?
Bid Section

A
Section

n
Section

c Total weeks

3oulder, CO x X X X X x X x x
$ 107,613.00 No Bid No Bid $107,613.00 24-28 Weeks

:olumbia, SC x x X X X x X X X
$ 103,903.00 $ 41,440.00 No Bid $145,343.00 4 Weeks

3 lunrteo Greenhouse Systems, Inc.
I edqerton, wl
I

X x X x X Price included 5-8 Weks

4 wrndnoy uree
Richmond, IN X x x x x x X x $ 79,785.00 $ 60,200.00 No Bid $1 39,985.00

(A) U-l2 Weeks
(B) 3 Weeks

x X $ 116,264.00 $ 24,740.O0 $141,004.00


